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National Youth Day
Students Council of International
Institute of Management Studies 
 organized an interesting event on the
occasion of National Youth Day. Events
like- E-Banner Competition, Essay
Writing Competition, Extempore etc.



Lohri Celebration
SaiBalaji Education Society had organized
"LOHRI CELEBRATION" for their students.
All seniors, students made this event more
auspicious. The event was started with the
ritual of Lohri festival and ending up with
Dhol Beats.



Faculty Development Program 
SaiBalaji Education Society had organized
a "Faculty Development Program" on the
topic " Bringing the Real World of Business
& Research Experiences into the
classroom".  The speaker for the session
was Dr. Abhishek Tripathi, Director,
Symbiosis University of Applied Sciences.
Also there was an additional seminar for
the faculties on the topic "Publication
Ethics& how to avoid Plagiarism in
Research". This session was conducted by
Dr. Neeraj Gupta, Associate Prof. of
N.L.Dalmia Institute of Management
Studies & Research.  



Makar Sankranti
SaiBalaji Education Society had organized
Kite Festival for their students on Makar
Sankranti Festival. All the students and
seniors relished the event.



Industry Academia Interface
SaiBalaji Education Society organized
Industry-Academia Interface Interface for
the students to learn about the various
aspects of  innovation and new product 
development in this turbulent time. 
Apart from this, our focus is also on the

overall development of the students. For
this we had also organized a workshop
with International Trainer on the topic
"Cultural Agility in a VUCA World".



SaiBalaji Education Society celebrated
73rd Republic Day with full of energy and
zeal. The program had started with the
formal event and unfurling the tricolor
flag i.e., the "Pride of the Nation" by Prof.
Manish R. Mundada Sir. All the faculty
members, students, seniors and alumni
were there for this propitious day. A group
of cadets performed a respectful parade
march. Subsequently, we moved to the
cultural part of the day, where students
give phenomenal performances includes
group dance, mime act, poetry, e-banner
competition, singing etc.

Republic Day





PLACEMENTS
NAME COMPANY

Shivam Umare HOOD

Allied Market

Research
Anjali Vaishnav

Prerna Dubey

Jaykant Singh

Piyush Muraka

Shyam Sharma

Vikram Pawar

Amit Giri

Sanket Patil

Sourabh Chavan

Satguru

TresVista

EY

ITC

ITC

Satguru

Satguru

Satguru



NAME COMPANY

Rohit Yadav

Janhvi Bhagwat

Komal Kumari

Apoorva Yadav

Abhishek Dagor

Nikita Sharma

Gouranga Dash

Priscilla Gaikwad

Shivangi Muraka

Suhana Quadri

Sayali Kodke

Prajakta Joshi

Satguru

NEEYAMC

UTI

UTI

upGrad

upGrad

pwc

pwc

pwc

pwc

pwc

pwc



NAME COMPANY

Arti Singh

Sonali Gupta

Nikita Khainar

Nidhi Singh

Vishwesh Shukla

Sarika

Harsh Mehta

Afrin Raheman

Jenifer Jacob

Dhanshri Mankar

Purva Galphade

Yash Chandankhede

pwc

pwc

pwc

pwc

pwc

pwc

pwc

pwc

pwc

pwc

pwc

pwc


